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Further to your Freedom of Information Act request, please find the Trust’s response, 
in blue bold text below: 
 

Request and Royal Devon and Exeter NHS Foundation Trust 
Response 

I would like to request the following information: 

1) The total number of cancer patients who have been referred by you to mental 
health services during their treatment cancer under your services, in each year since 
2010. 

2) A breakdown of that total figure into categories for the reason given for the cancer 
patients' referral, in each year since 2010. 

3) A breakdown of that total figure into categories for the kinds of cancer that 
referred patients are suffering.  

4) Details on average waiting time that cancer patients have faced while waiting for 
referral to mental health services each year over the past 10 years. 

The Trust are not able to produce this information as it is not data/information 
that the Trust.  The Freedom of Information Act does not oblige a public 
authority to create information to answer a request if the requested 
information is not held. It does not place a duty upon public authorities to 
answer a question unless recorded information exists. The Freedom of 
Information duty is to only provide the recorded information held. 
We can confirm that our Trust does not hold the information that you have 
requested.  To establish whether the information was held we made enquiries 
with our Oncology team. 
If the information was held by the Trust it would have to be held by the above 
mentioned department.  
 
Cancer patients are offered counselling and support through our trained CNS 
teams and FORCE colleagues as well as higher level support from our 
Enhanced Supportive Care Psychologist and DPT services as required. 
 
You can submit a Freedom of Information request by email to: 
 dpt.saferinformation@nhs.net  
or by letter to: 
  
Devon Partnership NHS Trust, Wonford House, Dryden Road, Exeter, EX2 5AF. 
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