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Further to your Freedom of Information Act request, please find the Trust’s response, 
in blue bold text below: 
 
 

Request and Royal Devon and Exeter NHS Foundation Trust 
Response 

 
 
Q1.  How many patients has your Trust treated (for any indication) in the last 12 
months with the following drugs: 

·         Piperacillin/tazobactam   
·         Ceftazidime/avibactam (Zavicefta)  
·         Ceftolozane/tazobactam (Zerbaxa)  
·         Meropenem/ vaborbactam (Vaborem) 
·         Cefiderocol (Fetcroja) 
·         Carbapenems (such as: Meropenem, Imipenem/cilastatin, Ertapenem)  
·         Aminoglycosides (such as: Gentamicin, Amikacin, Tobramycin)  
·         Cephalosporins (such as: Cefotaxime, Ceftazidime, Ceftriaxone)  
·         Quinolones   (such as: Ciprofloxacin, Levofloxacin, Ofloxacin)  
·         Polymixins (such as: Colistin)  
·         Amphotericin B/amphotericin liposomal (AmBisome) 
·         Isavuconazole (Cresemba) 
·         Posaconazole (Noxafil) 
 

We can confirm that our Trust does not hold the information that you have 
requested. To establish whether the information was held we conducted a 
thorough search, and made enquiries with our Business Intelligence and 
Coding teams. 
If the information was held by the Trust it would have to be held by the above 
mentioned departments.  
The Trust is unable to respond to question 1, as we do not hold information in 
our coding systems for specific codes for individual antibiotics or antifungals. 
We also have to abide by a national standard instructing us to only code IV 
infusions and IV injections if the patient is admitted solely for this.  
 
The Freedom of Information Act does not oblige a public authority to create 
information to answer a request if the requested information is not held. It 
does not place a duty upon public authorities to answer a question unless 
recorded information exists. The  Freedom of Information Act duty is to only 
provide the recorded information held. 
 
  



 
 
Q2.  How many patients has your Trust treated in the last 12 months for: 

·         Complicated Intra Abdominal Infections (cIAI) - 165 
·         Complicated Urinary tract infections (cUTI) - 2330 
·         Hospital Acquired Pneumonia 0 (HAP) and/or Ventilator Associated · ·
      Pneumonia (VAP) ≤5 

Five  ≤5.   - In accordance with section 40 (2) of the Freedom of   Information 
Act 2000, we are unable to provide figures where the number of patients is less 
than or equal to five and could risk the identification of those patients or staff 
and breach Caldicott principles.  
 
This follows NHS Digital (formerly HSCIC) analysis guidance (2014) which 
states that small numbers within local authorities, wards, postcode districts, 
CCG’s providers and Trusts may allow identification of patients and staff and 
should not be published. 

·         Mucormycosis - 0 
 
Q3.  For patients treated with Ceftazidime/avibactam (Zavicefta) in the last 12 
months, can you please provide the number of patients suffering from: 

·         Complicated Intra Abdominal Infections (cIAI)  
·         Complicated Urinary Tract infections (cUTI) 
·         Hospital Acquired Pneumonia (HAP) and/or Ventilator Associated 

Pneumonia (VAP) 
·         Gram-Negative bacterial infections 
 

It’s is not possible to supply an answer to this question either (patients who 
are treated with Ceftazidime/avibactam (Zavicefta),  as the Trust does not  
currently record that level of detail , and it is not held at that level in the Trust 
Pharmacy Department. 
 
 
 


