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Further to your Freedom of Information Act request, please find the Trust’s response, 
in blue bold text below: 
 
 

Request and Royal Devon and Exeter NHS Foundation Trust 
Response 

 
 
I would like to request the following via the Freedom of Information Act 2000.   
  
1. Which suicide risk assessments do you use at your trust?  
2. What training do your staff undertake in using those suicide risk assessments?   
3. What training do your staff have in assessing risk of suicide in general?   
4. What is the procedure your staff follow when they identify a person at risk of 

suicide?   
5. How many people have been assessed for risk of suicide 

between 2012 and 2020, if possible by month and department  
6. How many people were identified as at risk of suicide between 2012 and 2020, 

if possible by month and department  
 
 
The information requested above is not held on the Trust systems. 
The Freedom of Information Act does not oblige a public authority to create 
information to answer a request if the requested information is not held. It 
does not place a duty upon public authorities to answer a question unless 
recorded information exists. The Freedom of Information Act duty is to only 
provide the recorded information held. 
I can confirm that our Trust does not hold the information that you have 
requested. To establish whether the information was held we conducted a 
thorough search, and made enquiries with the trust Risk team, Emergency 
Department team, and Safe Guarding teams. 
If the information was held by the Trust it would have to be held by the above 
mentioned departments.  
 
You may contact the Team at the DPT (Devon Partnership Trust) on the 
following link:-  The Trust would be able to assist you. 
 
https://www.dpt.nhs.uk/about/corporate-information/freedom-of-information 
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